Tabulation of Bids

County of Ware
Waycross, Georgia 31501

Sealed Bids: Bulk Oil
Date of Opening: May 10, 2011
Department: Vehicle Maint

Invitations Extended: 8 Invitations Received: 2

SAE 15W40

SAE 10W30

SAE 10W20

SAE 5W20

SAE 5W30

SAE 20W50

GEAR OIL

MULTIPURPOSE GREASE

HYDRAULIC FLUID-TRACTOR

AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID

DRIVE TRAIN FLUID

EXTENDED LIFE ANTIFREEZE

ANTIFREEZE

PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT

BRAND

Bennett Oil Company
Waycross, GA 31502

11.88/Gallon
2.57/Quart
2.57/Quart
2.57/Quart
2.57/Quart
2.57/Quart

55.30/Bucket
2.25/Tube

38.85/Bucket
12.75/Bucket
11.80/Gallon

8.35/Gallon
7.50/Gallon

N/A

Conoco Phillips

58] — S o8
& B = c o S
¥e] — f' [e) 8 Em™
— M %)
™ (&) _ ™ o > <
c < = Q< [
_< =0 O < =RU) 5 ©
50 < - c O g s X
o - = 0 S - X o 0 O
[T o o =T & o =
So ns I o L 0o g2
L o S5 8 E T o O =
milfal T = s > a = Om
NO BID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID 13.99/Gallon
NO BID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID 3.25/Quart
NO BID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID No Bid
NO BID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID 3.25/Quart
NO BID | NOBID | NO BID NO BID 3.25/Quart
NO BID | NOBID | NO BID NO BID 3.25/Quart
NO BID | NOBID | NO BID NO BID
NO BID | NOBID | NO BID NO BID 2.60/Tube
NO BID | NOBID | NO BID NO BID
NO BID | NOBID | NO BID NO BID 14.08/Bucket
NO BID | NOBID | NO BID NO BID 13.03/Gallon
NO BID | NOBID | NO BID NO BID 9.98/Gallon
NO BID | NOBID | NO BID NO BID 8.95/Gallon
NO BID | NOBID | NOBID NO BID N/A
Various

COMMENTS:

Prepared By: Elizabeth Hope

Awarded By:
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SAE 15W40 NO BID NO BID

SAE 10W30 NO BID NO BID

SAE 10W20 NO BID NO BID

SAE 5W20 NO BID NO BID

SAE 5W30 NO BID NO BID

SAE 20W50 NO BID NO BID

GEAR OIL NO BID NO BID

MULTIPURPOSE GREASE NO BID NO BID

HYDRAULIC FLUID-TRACTOR NO BID NO BID

AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID NO BID NO BID

DRIVE TRAIN FLUID NO BID NO BID

EXTENDED LIFE ANTIFREEZE NO BID NO BID

ANTIFREEZE NO BID NO BID

PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT NO BID NO BID

COMMENTS:

Prepared By: Elizabeth Hope

Awarded By:
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