1.0 NBA/WNBA REPLICA
JERSEYS

BRAND

WITH SPONSOR
WITHOUT SPONSOR

2.0 LEATHER BASKET-
BALLS

BRAND

28.5

OFFICIAL

3.0 PRACTICE
BASKETBALLS
BRAND

25.0

27.0

28.5

OFFICIAL

4.0 COMPOSITE
BASKETBALLS
BRAND

25.0

27.0

28.5

OFFICIAL

5.0 DURABLE RUBBER
BASKETBALLS

BRAND

25.0

27.0

28.5

OFFICIAL

AD STARR

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

ANACONDA

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

ANACONDA
23.89
23.89

ANACONDA
NO BID
NO BID

9.75
9.95

ANACONDA
NO BID
11.90
12.75
12.75

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

FASTECH
GRAPHICS

AUGUSTA
12.69/13.69
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

RIDDELL

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
PAGES MISSING

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
PAGES MISSING

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
PAGES MISSING

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
PAGES MISSING

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

PAGES MISSING

BSN/SPORT
SUPPLY
GROUP

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

WILSON
44.64
44.64

MACGREGOR
NO BID
10.28
10.32
10.42

WILSON
NO BID
12.82
12.89
12.94

VOIT
4.22
4.24
4.49
472

THE SPORTS
SHOP

ALLESON
13.75/14.75
12.75/13.75

CHAMPRO
24.95
NO BID

CHAMPRO
24.00
24.00
24.00

NO BID

CHAMPRO
24.00
24.00
24.00

NO BID

NOT LISTED
14.95
14.95
14.95

NO BID

NOTES



6.0 MLB REPLICA
JERSEYS

BRAND

WITH SPONSOR
WITHOUT SPONSOR

7.0 MLB REPLICA
BASEBALL CAPS
BRAND
YOUTH
ADULT

8.0 MLB REPLICA
BASEBALL VISORS
BRAND

YOUTH

ADULT

9.0 SOFTBALLS
BRAND

11"

12"

OPTIC YELLOW FAST

10 YOUTH GAME
BASEBALLS
BRAND

PRICE PER DOZEN

11 YOUTH PRACTICE
BASEBALLS

BRAND

PRICE PER DOZEN

AD STARR

MAJESTIC
NO BID
11.12/11.98

0.D. CAP
4.48
4.48

O.D. CAP
4.21
4.21

AD STARR
37.88
37.88
34.88

AD STARR
24.55

AD STARR
19.88

ANACONDA

MAJESTIC
17.45/18.50
12.75/13.85

O.D. CAP
4.99
4.99

O.D. CAP
4.85
4.85

TRUMP
38.00
38.00
39.00

SPALDING
31.20

RAWLINGS
22.92

FASTECH
GRAPHICS

AUGUSTA
12.95/13.95*
10.95/11.95*

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

RIDDELL

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

PAGES MISSING

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

PAGES MISSING

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

RIDDELL
NO BID
NO BID

345.00 CASE

RIDDELL
23.99

RIDDELL
21.99

BSN/SPORT
SUPPLY
GROUP

MAJESTIC
16.22/17.22
12.42/13.42

O.D. CAP
4.69
4.69

O.D. CAP
472
4,72

MACGREGOR
170.22 CASE
191.46 CASE
233.94 CASE

MACGREGOR
27.98

MACGREGOR
26.88

THE SPORTS
SHOP

MLB
14.95/15.95
13.95/14.95

MLB
5.20
5.20

0.D. CAP
4.49
4.59

DIAMOND KING
39.90
39.90
39.90

DIAMOND KING
25.95

DIAMOND KING
20.95

NOTES



12 ADULT GAME
BASEBALLS
BRAND

PRICE PER DOZEN

13 T-BALLS
BRAND
PRICE PER DOZEN

14 BATTING TEES
BRAND
PRICE

15 CATCHER'S LEG
GUARDS

BRAND

5-8

8-12

12-15

15-UP

16 THROAT GUARDS
BRAND
PRICE

17 KNEE SAVERS
BRAND
YOUTH
ADULT

18 CHEST
PROTECTORS
BRAND
JUNIOR
YOUTH

PREP

ADULT

AD STARR

AD STARR
38.88

AD STARR
18.48/19.88

ASI
19.00

AD STARR
17.88
23.88
25.88
27.88

AD STARR
1.95

AD STARR
14.88
14.88

AD STARR
23.88
25.88
28.88
30.88

ANACONDA

TRUMP
28.92

WORTH
27.48/31.80

CHAMPION
16.95

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

RAWLINGS
14.95
14.95

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

FASTECH
GRAPHICS

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

RIDDELL

RIDDELL
32.99

RIDDELL
20.99/20.99

RIDDELL
23.99

RIDDELL
14.99
16.99
17.99
25.99

RIDDELL
4.28

RIDDELL
19.99
19.99

RIDDELL
10.25
11.99
14.25
14.25

BSN/SPORT
SUPPLY
GROUP

MACGREGOR
44.76

MACGREGOR
31.96/31.99

MACGREGOR
14.64

MACGREGOR
21.93
22.63
26.88
33.94

MACGREGOR
1.92

MACGREGOR
8.32
8.64

MACGREGOR
24.56
25.62
30.52
30.98

THE SPORTS

SHOP NOTES

DIAMOND KING
49.95

DIAMOND KING
20.95/20.95

DIAMOND KING
14.95

DIAMOND KING
15.00
16.50
18.95
21.00

ADAMS
2.75

DIAMOND KING
10.00
11.50

DIAMOND KING
15.95
16.95
18.00
21.50



19 CATCHER'S HELMET

BRAND
PRICE
COLORS AVAILABLE

20 HOCKEY STYLE
CATCHER'S MASK
BRAND

PRICE

COLORS AVAILABLE

21 CATCHER'S FACE
MASK

BRAND

PRICE

22 CATCHER'S MITTS
BRAND

JUNIOR

YOUTH

PREP

FAST PITCH

10 AND UNDER

11 AND UP

23 BATTING HELMETS
WITH FACE MASK
BRAND

PRICE W/GUARD
MALE

FEMALE

COLORS AVAILABLE

AD STARR

AD STARR
28.88
BLK/RED/RYL

AD STARR
31.00
BLK/RED/RYL

NO BID
NO BID

MIZUNO
29.00
35.00
45.00

35.00
45.00

ALL-STARR

21.00
21.00
NVY/BLK/RED
RYL/DK GRN

ANACONDA

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

MULTIPLE
23.95
23.95
23.95

33.75
39.95

RAWLINGS

24.75
24.75
NOT LISTED

FASTECH
GRAPHICS

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

RIDDELL

RIDDELL
49.99
BLK/SCLT
NVY/RYL

RIDDELL
49.99
BLK/SCLT
NVY/RYL

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

RIDDELL

20.99
20.99
BLK/SCLT
NVY/RYL

BSN/SPORT
SUPPLY
GROUP

MACGREGOR
27.48
BLK/SCLT/RYL

MACGREGOR
27.48
BLK/SCLT/RYL

MACGREGOR
17.72

MACGREGOR
30.82
34.96
35.93

NO BID
39.69

RAWLINGS

21.94
21.94
BLK/SCLT
NVY/RYL

THE SPORTS
SHOP

CHAMPRO
31.95
BLK/NVY

CHAMPRO
59.95
BLK/NVY

CHAMPRO
22.00

CHAMPRO
49.00
49.00
49.00

49.00
49.00

CHAMPRO

23.00
23.00
BLK/NVY

NOTES



BSN/SPORT

FASTECH SUPPLY THE SPORTS
AD STARR ANACONDA GRAPHICS RIDDELL GROUP SHOP NOTES

24 YOUTH BASEBALL
BATS
BRAND LOUISVILLE NO BID NO BID NO BID EASTON H&B
25" 10.00/16.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 18.95
26" 10.00/16.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 18.95
27" 8.00/21.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 15.92 18.95
28" 8.00/21.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 15.92 18.95
29" 8.00/21.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 15.92 18.95
30" 8.00/21.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 15.92 18.95
25 JENNIE FINCH
FASTPITCH BAT
27" 39.00 45.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
28" 39.00 45.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
29" 39.00 45.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
30" 39.00 45.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
31" 39.00 45.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
32" 39.00 45.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
26 THROW DOWN
BASES

10.00 5.85 NO BID 35.98 6.22 15.00
27 B-BALL PITCHER'S L
SHAPE SCREEN

118.00 NO BID NO BID 164.99 127.39 129.00

28 SOFTBALL
PITCHER'S PROTECTOR
125.00 NO BID NO BID 164.99 128.27 159.00



29 HOLLYWOOD STYLE
BASES

BRAND

WITH ANCHORS

30 HOLLYWOOD
DOUBLE FIRST BASE
BRAND

PRICE

31 MLB HOME PLATE
BRAND
PRICE

32 PITCHER'S PLATES
BRAND
4" X 18"
6" X 24"

33 4-WAY PITCHER'S
RUBBER

BRAND

4" X 18"

6" X 24"

34 STEP-DOWN
PITCHER'S RUBBER
BRAND

4" X 18"

6" X 24"

35 PORTABLE
PITCHER'S MOUND
BRAND

YOUTH
INTERMEDIATE
ADULT

AD STARR ANACONDA
ASI CHAMPRO
98.00 115.95
ASI SCHUTT
78.00 223.50
ASI SCHUTT
38.88 99.50
ASI NO BID
12.00 NO BID
14.00 NO BID
ASI NO BID
39.00 NO BID
49.00 NO BID
ASI NO BID
29.00 NO BID
39.00 NO BID
PROP PITCH PROP PITCH
775.00* 859.00
1195.00* 1,275.00
1975.00* 2,075.00
*SHIPPING

NOT INCL

FASTECH
GRAPHICS

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

RIDDELL

RIDDELL
128.99

RIDDELL
95.99

NO BID
NO BID

RIDDELL
6.25
10.99

RIDDELL
50.99
61.99

RIDDELL
40.99
50.99

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

PAGES MISSING

BSN/SPORT
SUPPLY
GROUP

MACGREGOR
110.96

MACGREGOR
77.24

MACGREGOR
56.36

MACGREGOR
7.52
12.24

MACGREGOR
27.64
53.44

MACGREGOR
26.14
37.96

PROP PITCH
768.72
1,268.76
2,238.82

THE SPORTS

SHOP NOTES

DIAMOND KING
97.00

CHAMPRO
98.00

DIAMOND KING
49.95

CHAMPRO
8.95
8.25

CHAMPRO
44.95
39.95

CHAMPRO
34.00
39.00

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID



36 PORTABLE FENCING

BRAND

150 FT ROLL
300 FT ROLL
11' TIE WRAP

37 PITCHING MACHINE

38 NFL FOOTBALL
JERSEY

BRAND

WITH SPONSOR
WITHOUT SPONSOR

39 FOOTBALL PANTS
BRAND

WITH PADS
WITHOUT PADS

40 YOUTH FOOTBALL
HELMETS

BRAND

SIZES AVAILABLE
PRICE

41 YOUTH SHOULDER
PADS

BRAND

XS

SM

MD

LG

XL

XXL

AD STARR

TSI
395.00*
895.00*
NO BID

*SHIPPING NOT

INCL

1,155.00

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

ANACONDA

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

CHAMPRO
15.25
9.20

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

BIKE
27.00
27.00
27.00
27.00
43.95
NO BID

FASTECH
GRAPHICS

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

AUGUSTA
14.49/16.49
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

RIDDELL

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

PAGES MISSING

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

PAGES MISSING

RIDDELL
NO BID
8.90

RIDDELL
XXS-XL
59.00/86.00

RIDDELL
24.99
25.99
26.99
28.99
29.99
30.99

BSN/SPORT
SUPPLY
GROUP

BSN
246.98
18.94
NO BID

1,197.39

REEBOK
26.58 YTH
21.98 YTH

ALLESON
14.64
10.72

SCHUTT
XS,SM,MD,LG
58.98

PRODOWN
25.29
27.22
28.39
29.12
30.22

NO BID

THE SPORTS
SHOP

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

1,599.00

ADVANTAGE
13.95/15.95
11.95/13.95

ADVANTAGE
12.95
8.00

STAR
XXS-XXL
49.95

BIG DOG
26.95
29.95
32.95
34.95
38.00
42.00

NOTES



42 FOOTBALL CHIN
STRAPS

BRAND

2 POINT

4 POINT

43 LEATHER
FOOTBALLS
BRAND

PEE WEE

JR

YOUTH

44 CHEERLEADING
UNIFORMS (1-PIECE)
BRAND

YOUTH

ADULT

45 CHEERLEADING
UNIFORMS (3-PIECE)
BRAND

YOUTH

ADULT

46 POM-POMS
BRAND

PRICE PER PAIR
COLORS AVAILABLE

47 HAND HELD POM-
POMS

BRAND

PRICE

6" X 24"

AD STARR

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

ANACONDA

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

MULTIPLE
28.75
29.75
33.95

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

FASTECH
GRAPHICS

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

AUGUSTA
28.50
30.99

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

RIDDELL

RIDDELL
4.50
4.50

RIDDELL
22.99
27.99
28.99

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

BSN/SPORT
SUPPLY
GROUP

PRODOWN
NO BID
2.58

WILSON
32.92
34.23
38.18

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

THE SPORTS
SHOP

STAR
3.25
3.95

WILSON
26.00
29.00
32.00

ALLESON
23.00
26.00

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NOTES



48 MOUTH GUARDS
WITH STRAP
BRAND

PRICE

49 UNIVERSAL JAW
PADS

BRAND

3/4"

1"

11/4"

50 KICK-OFF TEES
BRAND
PRICE

51 EXTRA POINT TEES
BRAND
PRICE

52 FLAG FOOTBALL T-
SHIRTS
BRAND
YOUTH
ADULT

53 GOOSENECK GOAL
POSTS
PRICE

54 FOOTBALL/SOCCER
COMBO GOAL
PRICE

AD STARR

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ANACONDA

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

FASTECH
GRAPHICS

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

GILPAN
7.95
8.95

NO BID

NO BID

RIDDELL

RIDDELL
0.40

RIDDELL
1.00
1.00
1.00

RIDDELL
4.00

RIDDELL
4.00

RIDDELL
11.10
11.10

NO BID

NO BID

BSN/SPORT
SUPPLY
GROUP

ADAMS
0.32

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

BSN
1.36

BSN
1.68

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

2699.49 PR

1488.98 PR

THE SPORTS
SHOP

ADAMS
0.75

ATHLETIC
4.00
4.10
4.25

CHAMPRO
2.95

CHAMPRO
3.25

JERZEES
5.75
6.75

900.00

NO BID

NOTES



55 NYLON TENNIS NET
PRICE

56 ENDURO HOSE REEL
PRICE

57 CLEAR FIELD HOSES
PRICE

58 PRO 1" NOZZLE
PRICE

59 INFIELD LIP BROOM
PRICE

60 3-WAY BATTERS
BOX TEMPLATE
PRICE

61 DOUBLE PLAY RAKE
PRICE

62 HEAVY DUTY DRAG
MAT
PRICE

63 WIDE SWEEP FAN
RAKE
PRICE

64 DIAMOND PUMP
PRICE

AD STARR

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

ANACONDA

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

FASTECH
GRAPHICS

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

RIDDELL

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

179.00

NO BID

57.50

275.00

NO BID

NO BID

BSN/SPORT
SUPPLY
GROUP

106.94

420.98

379.93

79.63

88.92

179.94

52.72

232.76

54.69

92.19

THE SPORTS
SHOP

119.00

449.95

489.90

69.00

149.95

299.95

79.95

479.00

NO BID

139.00

NOTES

10



	FY 13

