
AD STARR ALL STAR ATHLETIC ALUMINUM 
ATHLETIC EQUIP BAKER'S SPORTS BSN/SPORT SUPPLY 

GROUP RIDDELL NOTES

1.0 LEATHER BASKET-
BALLS
BRAND NO BID WILSON EVOL NO BID WILSON MACGREGOR RIDDELL
MEN'S/WOMENS 28.5 NO BID 46.34 NO BID 45.50 24.70 67.90
MEN'S/WOMEN'S OFFIC NO BID 46.34 NO BID 45.50 24.91 67.90

2.0 PRACTICE   
BASKETBALLS
BRAND NO BID WILSON NO BID SPALDING MACGREGOR RIDDELL
MEN'S/WOMEN'S 25.0 NO BID 11.50 NO BID 18.25 NO BID NO  BID
MEN'S/WOMEN'S 27.0 NO BID 11.50 NO BID 18.25 9.73 NO  BID
MEN'S/WOMEN'S 28.5 NO BID 11.50 NO BID 18.25 10.07 77.00
MEN'S/WOMEN'S OFFIC NO BID 11.50 NO BID 18.25 10.25 77.00

3.0 SOFTBALLS
BRAND AD STARR NO BID NO BID DUDLEY MACGREGOR NO  BID
11" 39.00 NO BID NO BID 59.99 35.53 NO  BID
12" 46.00 NO BID NO BID 59.99 44.61 NO  BID

4.0 YOUTH GAME 
BASEBALLS
BRAND AD STARR WILSON NO BID DIAMOND MACGREGOR RIDDELL
PRICE PER DOZEN 36.00 48.74 NO BID 43.25 34.26 30.00

5.0 YOUTH PRACTICE 
BASEBALLS
BRAND AD STARR WILSON NO BID DIAMOND MACGREGOR RIDDELL
PRICE PER DOZEN 28.00 44.45 NO BID 28.00 30.94 25.69

6.0 ADULT GAME 
BASEBALLS
BRAND AD STARR WILSON NO BID DIAMOND MACGREGOR RIDDELL
PRICE PER DOZEN 48.00 58.95 NO BID 57.75 46.74 38.78
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7.0 T-BALLS  
BRAND MACGREGOR NO BID NO BID NO BID MACGREGOR MACGREGOR
PRICE PER DOZEN 45.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 37.06 27.88

8.0 BATTING TEES  
BRAND AD STARR NO BID MACGREGOR NO BID MACGREGOR MACGREGOR
PRICE 13.50 NO BID 28.00 NO BID 12.29 17.74

9.0 CATCHER'S LEG 
GUARDS
BRAND AD STARR CHAMPRO NO BID CHAMPRO MACGREGOR RIDDELL
5-8 18.00 23.12 NO BID 17.99 23.33 21.50
8-12 28.00 28.79 NO BID 21.50 24.12 21.00
12-15 29.00 35.19 NO BID 27.50 28.55 26.00
15-UP 38.00 41.72 NO BID 28.99 35.96 33.30

10 THROAT GUARDS
BRAND AD STARR CHAMPRO NO BID CHAMPRO MACGREGOR RIDDELL
COLOR:  BLACK NO BID
PRICE 2.50 3.75 NO BID 3.25 2.33 3.25

11 KNEE SAVERS
BRAND AD STARR CHAMPRO NO BID CHAMPRO MACGREGOR RIDDELL
COLOR:  BLACK NO BID
YOUTH 12.00 12.05 NO BID 9.50 8.06 13.12
ADULT 12.00 13.19 NO BID 10.75 8.23 13.12

12 CHEST PROTECTORS
BRAND AD STARR CHAMPRO NO BID CHAMPRO MACGREGOR RIDDELL
COLOR:  BLACK NO BID
JUNIOR 25.00 21.99 NO BID 15.50 26.18 11.88
YOUTH 27.00 17.72 NO BID 16.99 27.37 12.20
PREP 29.00 23.12 NO BID 21.50 32.34 15.50
ADULT 32.00 26.39 NO BID 21.50 33.14 14.49

13 CATCHER'S HELMET
BRAND ALLSTAR CHAMPRO NO BID CHAMPRO RAWLINGS NO BID
PRICE 28.00 35.87 NO BID 29.50 36.39 NO BID
COLORS AVAILABLE BLACK BLK/RYL/NVY/SCLT NO BID BLACK BLK/RYL/SCLT NO BID

2



AD STARR ALL STAR ATHLETIC ALUMINUM 
ATHLETIC EQUIP BAKER'S SPORTS BSN/SPORT SUPPLY 

GROUP RIDDELL NOTES

14 HOCKEY STYLE 
CATCHER'S MASK
BRAND ALLSTAR CHAMPRO NO BID CHAMPRO RAWLINGS RIDDELL
PRICE 45.00 51.92 NO BID 47.25 57.28 62.08
COLORS AVAILABLE BLK/RED/NAVY/RYL BLK/RYL/NVY SCLT NO BID BLK/RD/NVY/RYL BLK/RYL/SCLT BLK/SCLT/NVY/YW

15 CATCHER'S MITTS
BRAND MIZUNO NO BID NO BID CHAMPRO NO BID NO BID
10 AND UNDER 34.00 NO BID NO BID 35.99 NO BID NO BID
11 AND UP 40.00 NO BID NO BID 42.50 NO BID NO BID

16 BATTING HELMETS WITH 
FACE MASK
BRAND RAWLINGS EASTON NO BID EASTON MACGREGOR RIDDELL
PRICE W/GUARD NO BID
MALE 23.88 26.75 NO BID 26.00 24.87 29.25
FEMALE 23.88 26.75 NO BID 26.00 24.87 29.25
COLORS AVAILABLE NOT LISTED BLK/RD/NVY/RYL NO BID BLK/NVY,RD/RYL BLACK BLK/NVY/RYL/SCLT

17 YOUTH BASEBALL BATS
BRAND RAWLINGS EASTON NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
25" 20.00 18.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
26" 20.00 18.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
27" 20.00 18.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
28" 20.00 18.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
29" 20.00 18.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
30" 20.00 18.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

18 JENNIE FINCH 
FASTPITCH BAT

BRAND LOUISVILLE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
27" 23.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
28" 23.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
29" 23.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
30" 23.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
31" 23.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
32" 23.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 3
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19 THROW DOWN BASES
BRAND ASI CHAMPRO NO BID CHAMPRO BSN RIDDELL
PRICE 12.30 9.68 NO BID 5.50 5.41 12.29

20  B-BALL PITCHER'S L 
SHAPE SCREEN
BRAND LOUISVILLE CHAMPRO NO BID CHAMPRO BSN RIDDELL
PRICE 115.00 109.75 NO BID 89.99 117.22 118.89

21 SOFTBALL PITCHER'S 
PROTECTOR
BRAND ASI NO BID NO BID CHAMPRO BSN RIDDELL
PRICE 125.00 NO BID NO BID 87.50 116.76 148.59

22  HOLLYWOOD STYLE 
BASES
BRAND ASI CHAMPRO AAE ADAMS MACGREGOR RIDDELL
WITH ANCHORS 110.00 173.98 152.85 100.00 115.34 124.88

23 HOLLYWOOD DOUBLE 
FIRST BASE
BRAND ASI CHAMPRO NO BID ADAMS MACGREGOR RIDDELL
PRICE 78.00 108.75 NO BID 134.00 73.56 105.69

24  MLB HOME PLATE
BRAND ASI CHAMPRO NO BID CHAMPRO MACGREGOR RIDDELL
PRICE 63.00 61.50 NO BID 50.99 47.45 58.80

25  PITCHER'S PLATES
BRAND ASI CHAMPRO CHAMPION CHAMPRO MACGREGOR RIDDELL
4" X 18" 10.50 10.79 NO BID 7.50 7.76 9.99
6" X 24" 14.50 13.05 16.25 9.99 10.98 16.05
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26 4-WAY PITCHER'S 
RUBBER
BRAND ASI CHAMPRO CHAMPION CHAMPRO MACGREGOR RIDDELL
4" X 18" 39.00 72.19 NO BID 29.50 29.94 65.10
6" X 24" 62.00 77.12 72.00 56.99 49.27 40.69

27 STEP-DOWN PITCHER'S 
RUBBER
BRAND ASI CHAMPRO CHAMPION CHAMPRO MACGREGOR RIDDELL
4" X 18" 34.00 42.19 NO BID 28.99 30.06 35.79
6" X 24" 55.00 59.10 51.00 41.50 39.27 46.79

28 PORTABLE PITCHER'S 
MOUND

BRAND PITCH PRO NO BID NO BID NO BID PROPER PITCH NO BID
YOUTH 890.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 746.38 NO BID
INTERMEDIATE 1,195.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 1,159.42 NO BID
ADULT 2,150.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 2,101.45 NO BID

29 PORTABLE FENCING
BRAND TSI NO BID NO BID NO BID BSN NO BID
314FT 730.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 923.15 NO BID
471FT 1,010.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 1,326.68 NO BID

30 PITCHING MACHINE
BRAND JUGS NO BID NO BID JUGS JUGS JUGS M1300
PRICE 1,290.00 NO BID NO BID 1,300.00 2,835.44 3,458.00

31 YOUTH FOOTBALL 
HELMETS
BRAND NO BID NO BID NO BID SCHUTT SCHUTT RIDDELL
PRICE NO BID NO BID NO BID 65.00 66.27 70.00
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32 YOUTH SHOULDER PADS
BRAND NO BID CHAMPRO NO BID CHAMPRO GEAR PRO RIDDELL
XS NO BID 33.65 NO BID 28.99 30.92 27.00
SM NO BID 33.65 NO BID 28.99 32.55 28.00
MD NO BID 33.65 NO BID 28.99 36.64 30.00
LG NO BID 33.65 NO BID 28.99 37.61 37.00
XL NO BID 33.65 NO BID 28.99 38.84 40.00
XXL NO BID 33.65 NO BID 28.99 NO BID 42.00

33 FOOTBALL CHIN STRAPS
BRAND NO BID NO BID NO BID CHAMPRO NO BID RIDDELL
2 POINT NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 2.79
4 POINT NO BID NO BID NO BID 8.25 NO BID 4.75

34 LEATHER FOOTBALLS
BRAND NO BID WILSON NO BID WILSON WILSON RIDDELL
PEE WEE NO BID 36.75 NO BID 33.50 34.89 24.75
JR NO BID 38.00 NO BID 34.99 35.87 27.25
YOUTH NO BID 40.50 NO BID 37.25 38.18 27.75

35 POM-POMS
BRAND NO BID PIZAZZ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PRICE PER PAIR NO BID 12.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
COLORS AVAILABLE NO BID FOR/BLK/PNK/BLUE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

ORG/RED, ETC NO BID

36 MOUTH GUARDS WITH 
STRAP
BRAND NO BID WILSON NO BID WILSON WILSON RIDDELL
PRICE NO BID 0.48 NO BID 0.35 0.28 0.36

37 UNIVERSAL JAW PADS
BRAND NO BID NO BID NO BID SCHUTT SCHUTT NO BID
3/4" NO BID NO BID NO BID 4.25 4.43 NO BID
1" NO BID NO BID NO BID 4.25 4.43 NO BID

1 1/4" NO BID NO BID NO BID 4.25 4.43 NO BID
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38 KICK-OFF TEES
BRAND NO BID NO BID NO BID ATH SPEC BSN RIDDELL
PRICE NO BID NO BID NO BID 2.50 1.37 4.00

39 EXTRA POINT TEES
BRAND NO BID NO BID NO BID ATH SPEC BSN RIDDELL
PRICE NO BID NO BID NO BID 2.50 1.83 4.00

40 GOOSENECK GOAL 
POSTS
BRAND NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID ALUMAGOAL NO BID
PRICE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 2,982.32 NO BID

41 FOOTBALL/SOCCER 
COMBO GOAL
BRAND NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID ALUMAGOAL NO BID
PRICE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1,782.91 NO BID

42 VOLLEYBALLS
BRAND NO BID CHAMPRO NO BID CHAMPRO MACGREGOR NO BID

PRICE NO BID 17.92 NO BID 8.50 30.48 NO BID

43 SOCCER BALLS
BRAND NO BID CHAMPRO NO BID CHAMPRO MACGREGOR NO BID
SIZE 3 NO BID 7.95 NO BID 5.25 4.45 NO BID
SIZE 4 NO BID 7.95 NO BID 5.25 4.61 NO BID
SIZE 5 NO BID 7.95 NO BID 5.25 4.78 NO BID

44 DODGEBALLS
BRAND NO BID NO BID NO BID CHAMPION VOIT NO BID
6 1/4 NO BID NO BID NO BID 6.50 5.64 NO BID
8 1/4 NO BID NO BID NO BID 15.00 11.36 NO BID

45 NYLON TENNIS NET
BRAND NO BID NO BID NO BID CHAMPION MACGREGOR NO BID
PRICE NO BID NO BID NO BID 100.00 79.33 NO BID
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46 ENDURO HOSE REEL
BRAND NO BID NO BID NO BID TSI BSN NO BID
PRICE NO BID NO BID NO BID 275.00 420.98 NO BID

47 CLEAR FIELD HOSES

BRAND NO BID NO BID NO BID TSI BSN NO BID
PRICE NO BID NO BID NO BID 110.00 410.56 NO BID

48 PRO 1" NOZZLE FOR 
HOSE
BRAND NO BID NO BID NO BID TSI BSN NO BID
PRICE NO BID NO BID NO BID 82.00 88.77 NO BID

49 INFIELD LIP BROOM
BRAND NO BID NO BID NO BID TSI BSN NO BID
PRICE NO BID NO BID NO BID 100.00 93.16 NO BID

50 3-WAY ADJ BATTERS 
BOX TEMPLATE
BRAND NO BID NO BID NO BID TSI BSN RIDDELL
PRICE NO BID NO BID NO BID 145.00 74.36 175.89

51 DOUBLE PLAY RAKE
BRAND NO BID NO BID NO BID TSI BSN NO BID
PRICE NO BID NO BID NO BID 55.00 56.03 NO BID

52 HD DRAG MAT
BRAND NO BID NO BID NO BID TSI BSN NO BID
PRICE NO BID NO BID NO BID 290.00 172.45 NO BID

53 WIDE SWEEP FAN RAKE
BRAND NO BID NO BID NO BID TSI NO BID NO BID
PRICE NO BID NO BID NO BID 95.00 NO BID NO BID

54 DIAMOND PUMP
BRAND NO BID NO BID NO BID TSI BSN NO BID
PRICE NO BID NO BID NO BID 128.00 96.72 NO BID
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