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4" Single Column Trophies NO BID 3.75 2.75 2.45
6" Single Column Trophies NO BID 3.95 2.95 2.55
24" Two Column Champ Trophies NO BID 14.95 15.50 7.75
20" Two Column Runner Up Trophies NO BID 12.95 14.50 7.45
Plaques NO BID 9.95

2x8" Award Ribbon-First Place NO BID 0.31 0.32

2x8" Award Ribbon-Second Place NO BID 0.31 0.32

2x8" Award Ribbon-Third Place NO BID 0.31 0.32

Discount Rate for Non-Contract Items NO BID 15.00% % %
Per Letter Engraving Price NO BID

COMMENTS:

Prepared By: Elizabeth Hope

Awarded By:
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